
 
Homework Grid 

Year Group (teacher):  Y5 (Mr Jones) 

Half term:  Autumn 2 

 

 
Together we are Porter Croft 
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Read a book a week. Draw the main 
characters and write about their 

behaviour and personalities. 

Practise turning simple sentences into 
compound and complex sentences 

( see attachment) 

Practise addition of fractions to one 
whole. E.g. 0.2 +0.8= 1.0, 

0.37 + 0.63= 1.0 
0.356 + 0.644= 1.0 

You can download old sats papers for 
reading comprehension and maths 

From www.emaths.co.uk  

 

Write a letter to the local council to 
persuade them that they should collect 

the bins more often. 

Make models from junk material you 
might normally throw away. 

E.g. a stable with a manger and various 
nativity figures. 

Calculate your own carbon footprint on 
www.cooltheworld.com  

Use your persuasive techniques 
practised in Literacy to convince adults 
to walk or cycle a  journey they would 

usually drive. 

 

Visit a local pond and do a spot of 
pond-dipping. There’s one very near 

school on Ecclesall Rd- The Sunnybank 
Nature Reserve. 
(see attachment) 

Write a recount of any trip or outing 
you have been on. 

Draw a storyboard with captions for 
any book, film or play you have seen. 

Use recycled material to make a 
Christmas decoration or a Christmas 

card for a friend. 

 

Look up how to make mince pies and 
persuade an adult to help you make 

them. Make sure you measure 
ingredients correctly. 

Solve mathematical Christmas 
problems- (see attachment). 

Go on Argos.com- imagine you have 
£500 pounds to spend. Try to get as 
close as you can to £500 when you 

shop for ; A PS3, a bike, a football, a 
skipping rope, a watch, a kindle(any) 

and a hairbrush. 

Research “Keys” which help to identify 
plants and animals- here’s a good place 

to look- www.woodlands-

junior.kent.sch.uk/revision/science/li
ving/keys.html  
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